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of lunatics, being paupers Or criminals, in
[England." . *

An Act for the more effectual prevention of tl>e ;
use of false and deficient measures.

An Act to revive and continue, until the twenty-
fifth day of March one thousand eight1 hundred
and twenty, several laws relating to the encourage-
ment of the Greenland whale fisheries, and to the
allowing vessels employed in6the said fisheries to
complete their full number of men at certain ports.

An Act for continning the premiums allowed to
ships employed in the Southern whale fishery.

An Act to amend an Act of His present Ma-
jesty, for establishing a ferry across the River
Thames at Woolwich, in the county of Kent.

An Act for • enlarging the powers of an Act of
His present Majesty, for repairing! enlarging, and
improving the parish,church of.Hungerford, in the
counties of. Berks and Wilts.

An Act to anieQcJ an Act of His present Ma-
jesty, for building a new church, at Wakefield, in
the West Riding of the county of York.

An Act to light, watcb^ pjave, cleanse, and im-
prove the streets, iygUways, and places within the
borough of Preston, in the county palatine of Lan-
caster j and to provide fire-engines ambfiremen for
the protection of the said borough.

Arj Act to alter, extend, and amend the powers
of two Acts, passed in the tenth year of the raign
of His late Majesty King George the Second, and
HI the twelfth year of the reign of His. present
Majesty, for better paving, lighting, and watching
the, city of New Saruui, in the county of Wilts.
.. ^n^t,/orj,ajnenjding lw<^ Acts of His present
Majesty, for improving, certain plots of. ground be-
longing to the Right Honourable Ann Dowager
Baroness Southampton and other persons, in the
parish of Saint Pancras., in the county of. Middle-
sex.

An Act to amend an Act of His'present Ma-
jesty, for paving and otherwise improving the town
of Abergavenny, in the county ot' Monmouth.

An Act for amending and enlarging the powers
of two Acts of His present Majesty, for paving,
lighting, cleansing, and improving the town of
Ipswich, in the county of Suffolk; and removing
and preventing encroachments, obstructions, and
annoyances therein; , ai>d £or watching the said
town.

An Act for dividingj, inclosing, and selling the
waste lands and Lacunae, ami other commonable
rights, in the city aud county of the city of Lich-
field j to explain and amend an Act of His present
Majesty,, for paving, cleansing, lighting, watching,
and regulating the streets, lanes, and other ptfblic
places uithin the city of Lichfield, and the suburbs
thereof 3 and for better supplying the said city with
\vater.

An Act for building a market-house in the bo-
rough of Clifton Dartmouth Hardness, in the
county of Devon; and for better paving, lighting,
widening, and improving the streets and other
public places within the said borough.

An Act to rebuild the bridge in Bird-Street,
otherwise Bridge-Street, til the city of Lichfield.

An Act for rebuilding Temps ford-Bridge, in the
coiuity of Bedford.

An Act to alter and amend ap Act of the forty-

seventfi year of the reign of His present M^jcity,
for erecting a county-hall and other offices for the
county of Perth.

An Act for making and maintaining a turhpike
road from or near Mytholm Royd-Bridge, in the
West Riding of the county of York, to commu-
nicate with the road at or near the sixth mile-stone
from Rochdale, in the county of Lancaster.

An Act for-enlarging and altering the term and
powers of an Act of His present Majesty, for re-
pairing the road leading from the Cow Cawsey,
near the town of Newcastle-upon-Tyne, to the
town of Belford, and from thence to Bucktcm
Burn, in the county of Northumberland.

An Act for more effectually repairing the road
from Stirling to Dumbarton, and several other
roads, in the counties of Stirling, Dumbarton,
and Perth.

An Act for more eifectually repairing the road
leading from Royston, in the county of Hertford,
to Wandesford-Bridge, and from the town of
Huntingdon to Somersham, in the county of Hunt-
ingdon, so far as respects the middle division and
separate district of the said roads.

An Act to continue the term, and alter and
amend the powers, of three Acts of His present
.Majesty, for repairing the road from Lawton, in.
the county of Chester, to Burslein and Newcastic-
under-Lyme, in the county of Stafford, aujtf other-
roads therein mentioned; and also to mak£a new
road from Burslem aforesaid to Cobridgc, and a
branch therefrom te Bursleoi Church.

An Act for enlarging the term and powers of
two Acts of King George the Second, and two
Acts of His present Majesty, for repairing and
widening tke road from Rochdale, in the county
palatine of Lancaster, to.Halifax and Ealand, in
the West Riding of the county of York.

An Act for more effectually repairing the road
leading from Heron Syke to Kirkby in Kendal,
and from thence through Shap to Earnout-Bridge,
in the county of Westmorland ; and for making a
new road from the said road, at a place called Far
Cross Bank, near Kirkby in Kendal, to commu-
nicate with the intended canal from Lancaster to
Kirkby in Kendjtl, and to join the said road at or
near a place called -the Lound, .near Kirlj.by in
Kendal aforesaid.

An Act to continue the term, and alter and en-
large the powers, of two Acts of His present Ma-,
jesty, for amending the road from the bottom of
Galley-Hill to the Cross in Clanfield, in the county
of Oxford.

And seventeen private Acts.

Queen's-Palace, May 3, 181.5.

This day His Excellency the Baron Fagel, a
Member of the Corps des Nobles of the Province
of Holland, Ambassador Extraordinary and Pleni-
potentiary from His Majesty the King of the Ne-
therlands, Grand Dtike of Luxemburg, had au-
dience of Her Majesty; to which he was intro-
duced by Earl Morton, Her Majesty's Lord Cham-
berlain, and conducted by Robert Chester, Evj,
Assistant-Master of the Ceremonies.

This day Monsieur-de Freire, Minister Pleuipa-


